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EIR Ref: 2016/025 

 
 

4th August 2016 

 
 
 
REQUEST UNDER ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION (SCOTLAND) REGULATIONS 2004 
 
I refer to your email of 6th July 2016. We have applied the exemption under Section 39(2) of the 
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 as we have determined that the information sought in 
your request is environmental information. We are therefore handling your request under the 
terms of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (EIRs). The information 
falling within the scope of the EIRs is considered to fall within paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of the 
definition of environmental information. In this case the public interest in maintaining this 
exemption and in dealing with the request in line with the requirements of the EIRs outweighs any 
public interest in disclosing the information under FOISA. 
 
Your specific questions and the response from the National Park Authority are provided below. 
 
1. “When questioned about the number of places and how the increased figure of 33 was 
arrived at Gordon Watson stated that this was a result of an analysis of the rangers reports 
for the area although they have not been made available to us.” 

As confirmed in the Q&A sheet circulated in advance of the meeting and reiterated by Gordon 
Watson at the meeting, the proposed 33 pitches is based on the maximum number of pitches that 
the site can accommodate at periods of peak demand. 

“Can you confirm that the analysis of these reports will be made public and not just for 
Strathard but for the park as a whole?” 

As explained above, the proposed number of pitches is based on the maximum number that the 
site can accommodate at periods of peak demand. 

2. “Gordon Watson stated there were 30 full time rangers and in peak summer months a 
number of part time rangers in support. During the presentation GW confirmed that part 
time rangers would not be involved with enforcing bylaws leaving the 30 full time 
employees to do so.” 

As stated by Gordon Watson at the meeting, there are around thirty seasonal Ranger staff who 
will be involved in byelaw enforcement along with the full time Rangers. Seasonal Rangers would 
be expected to be involved in enforcement work. The reference made at the meeting by Gordon 
Watson was that Volunteer Rangers would not be expected to be involved directly in enforcing 
byelaws but would be involved in supporting the project. 
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 “GW stated that the park viewed overnight stop overs as between the hours of 7 PM to 7 
AM.” 

The existing East Loch Lomond camping management byelaws state that the term “over-night” 
shall mean from 7pm to 7am (or any part thereof), which is what Mr Watson was referring to. 

a.” Could you confirm for my understanding that rangers do work together in two's or 
threes?” 

Yes 

b. “That they work in shifts and what the shift pattern is?” 

Rangers work in shifts, which vary and are determined by peak visitor flows. 

c. “Can you confirm the planned man hours for patrols and how much time per working 
week will be spent in Strathard?” 

Plans for staff hours and time spent by Rangers on patrol in Stathard are not yet in place for the 
2017 season when the camping byelaws come into force. Accordingly I have to advise you under 
R10(4)(a) that this information is not held. 

3.”In a single sentence earlier in the meeting Gordon Watson associated the leaving of 
tents and rubbish in the management zone as fly tipping. I assume this is for the purpose 
of issuing your fixed penalty notice.” 

 “It seems strange that LLTNP can reassign the crime of littering to be viewed as fly 
tipping”  

The legislation itself does not provide a definition of litter or of fly tipping. However the Park 
Authority uses the following definitions from the Scottish Government litter strategy document: 
“Towards a litter-free Scotland, a strategic approach to higher qualify local environments”, 
http://www.gov.scot/Publications/2014/06/6565 

 Fly Tipping: The illegal dumping of waste - from a bin bag of household waste to large 
quantities of domestic, commercial or construction waste. 

 Litter: Waste in the wrong place in the wider environment. It can be all kinds of man-made 
materials. 
 

Authorised persons on witnessing an offence will be required to make a decision in the field as to 
whether to issue a notice. 

This decision must be based on whether there is suitably strong evidence that the responsible 
person has committed the offence and if it is in the public interest to issue. 

 “Can you confirm this has a legal basis and would be enforceable in the courts?” 

In 2014 the Scottish Parliament approved the Regulatory Reform (Scotland) Act 2014 which 
amongst many things amended the Environmental Protection Act 1990 to give Loch Lomond & 
The Trossachs National Park Authority (the Park Authority) the power to issue fixed penalty 
notices (FPNs) for the flytipping offence under section 33(1) and the littering offence under 
section 87 of the Environmental Protection Act 1990.  

 “Can you confirm if it is possible to challenge someone for fly tipping outside the 
management zone, is it a park wide offense?” 

The legislation, which permits the Park Authority to issue fixed penalty notices for fly tipping, is 
unrelated to the work on introducing camping management zones and camping byelaws. Fly 
tipping is an offence across the entire National Park. 

4. “Gordon Watson continued to explain the process of tackling individuals contravening 
the bylaws. He explained that it was the rangers remit to try and achieve this without 
recourse to fixed penalties or confrontation but if that failed, there were standing orders 
and easy recourse to involve the polices should the need arise. It is this involvement of the 

http://www.lochlomond-trossachs.org/
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police that I am interested in. Gordon Watson stated that the planned ranger patrols and 
the local police patrols were co-ordinated and the timing of the respective patrols where 
known to both the ranger service and the police making it simple for rangers to contact the 
nearest police officer to get support when required.” 

Police Scotland, the National Park Authority and Forestry Commission are partners in Operation 
Ironworks. The operation is intended to provide additional police resources to target and deal with 
the minority of visitors who are responsible for an increase in antisocial behaviour such as 
vandalism, theft, littering, assault and other forms of disruptive and irresponsible behaviour. This 
is achieved by intelligence-led high visibility proactive mobile and foot patrols targeting identified 
problem areas. Members of the public can report issues of concern to the police using the 101 
non-emergency number. 

“Can you give details ot these schedules as it would be very helpful for the “eyes on the 
ground” help that Gordon Watson requested and I could contact there ranger service or 
police directly if they were known to be in the area at the time of an incident.“ 

We are aware that communities, partner organisations and also visitors to the Park may want to 
report camping issues or possible byelaw infringements directly to us. We are currently assessing 
what systems we need to have in place to handle information from these sources and factor it into 
decision making about the deployment of resources. Once we have these in place we will 
publicise how to contact us and what information is most helpful to us to make the most of ‘eyes 
on the ground’ help. 

5. “The big problem facing the management zone is the unmanaged but accessible area on 
the south shore of Loch Ard. This effectively means that any individuals who want to over 
night camp in the area can walk 100 metres further on and continue as normal making a 
mockery of the management zone effectively increasing the number of camping spaces far 
beyond the headline 33 making the position on camping far worse, with greater numbers 
traveling to Loch Ard and Loch Chon and no way to control the total figure. This is of great 
concern as I envisage that when the park wide restrictions kick in that the area will be 
inundated with anti social campers as they search out new camping grounds.” 

The Land Reform (Scotland) Act 2003 provides a right of responsible access to land outwith the 
management zones. The Scottish Outdoor Access Code (SOAC) applies to people camping in 
these areas and they are expected to do so responsibly and without causing damage to the 
environment. The camping management zones where byelaws will apply are aimed at tackling 
car-borne camping close to public roads, as this is where the majority of issues arise. The 
byelaws are designed to apply to a corridor of around 200 metres from the public road.  

“Can you suggest any way that this can be stopped?” 

The Park Authority will continue to address the problem of irresponsible campers by working in 
conjunction with partners to continue to promote the messages in the Scottish Outdoor Access 
Code. Positive campaigns to promote responsible wild camping will continue to be an important 
part of managing camping behaviours both in the camping Management Zones and the wider 
National Park. 

“Could you tell me where I would find a copy of the minutes for this meeting.” 

The public meeting at Strathard Community Hall was an informal meeting for the Strathard 
Community. The Park Authority does not hold minutes for this meeting. Accordingly I have to 
advise under R10(4)a) of the EIRs that this information is not held. 

 
 
Yours sincerely 
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Information Officer 

info@lochlomond-trossachs.org 

 
 
 
 
Review Procedure 
If you are dissatisfied with this response, or the way in which the Authority has dealt with your 
request, you are entitled to ask the Authority to review its decision.  Please note that in order for a 
review to take place you must:- 
 

 Lodge a written request for a review within 40 working days of either the date on which 
you received a response from the University or the date by which you should have 
received a response under the terms of the Environmental Information (Scotland) 
Regulations 2004, whichever is the later.  
 

 Include your name, address for correspondence, a description of the original request, and 
the reasons why you are dissatisfied; and 

 
address your review request to the Director of Corporate Services: 
 

Jaki Carnegie 
Loch Lomond & The Trossachs National Park Authority 
National Park Headquarters 
Carrochan 
Carrochan Road 
Balloch   
G83 8EG 
E-mail: info@lochlomond-trossachs.org 

 
Please note that links provided to information available elsewhere are intended to assist you. 
Requests for information held by other public authorities, and any complaints regarding access to 
such information should be addressed to that authority. These review procedures relate only to 
information which is directly under the control of Loch Lomond & The Trossachs National Park 
Authority. 
 
The review of your request will be handled by staff who were not involved in the original decision.  
You will receive notice of the result of your review within 20 working days.   
 
If you are not satisfied with the response to your request for review, you can contact the Scottish 
Information Commissioner, the independent body which oversees the Environmental Information 

(Scotland) Regulations 2004, at: 

  
Scottish Information Commissioner  
Kinburn Castle  
Doubledykes Road 
St Andrews 
Fife 
KY16 9DS 
Tel: 01344 464 610 
Website: www.itspublicknowledge.info 
E-mail: enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info 
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