LOCH

LOMOND

&THE TROSSACHS
NATIONAL PARK

£ 4L
v
’

Loch Lomond & The Trossachs National Park Authority
Carrochan
Carrochan Road
Balloch
G83 8EG
FOI Ref: 2026-003
Date: 04 February 2025

Dear XXX
REQUEST UNDER FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (SCOTLAND) ACT 2002

We refer to your email of 27 January 2026, in which you requested information from
the National Park Authority. We have processed your request under the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002 and have provided our response below.

Your Request

I would like to make a freedom of information request concerning a camera | believe may be
owned/operated by the National Park Authority in Aberfoyle. The camera is located between
Aberfoyle Primary School and Aberfoyle Parish Church and points into a stream that flows
into the River Forth.

My questions are as follows:

1.) Is the camera owned/operated by the National Park Authority? If it is not, do you know
who does own/operate the camera?

2.) What is the function of the camera, and how is the camera monitored (e.qg.,
24hrs, periodically, in response to incidents).

3.) Could you please provide a still frame of camera's view?

Our Response

The camera you have enquired about is not owned or operated by the National Park
Authority and we do not hold any information about its ownership or operation. Therefore,
we inform you under section 17 of FOISA that the information you have requested is not
held.
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Further Information

While the National Park Authority does not hold any information about the ownership or
operation of the camera that you have asked us about, we would suggest you try the following
organisations:

e Stirling Council: foi@stirling.gov.uk
o Forth Rivers Trust: hello@forthriverstrust.org
e Scottish Environmental Protection Agency (SEPA): foi@sepa.org.uk

Yours sincerely

Information Management
Loch Lomond and the Trossachs National Park Authority
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Review Procedure

If you are dissatisfied with this decision, or the way in which the Authority has dealt with your
request, you are entitled to require the Authority to review its decision. Please note that in
order for a review to take place you are required to:

e Send your request for review in writing, setting out in full the reasons why you are
requesting a review.

e  Submit your review request within 40 working days of either the date on which you
received a response from the Authority or the date by which you should have
received a response under the terms of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002, whichever is the later.

e address your review request to:

Information Manager

Loch Lomond & The Trossachs National Park Authority
National Park Headquarters

Carrochan

Carrochan Road

Balloch

G83 8EG

E-mail: info@lochlomond-trossachs.org

The review will be handled by staff who were not involved in the original decision. You will
receive notice of the result of your review within 20 working days.

If you are not satisfied with the response to your request for review, you can contact the
Scottish Information Commissioner, the independent body which oversees the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002, at:

Scottish Information Commissioner
Kinburn Castle

Doubledykes Road

St Andrews

Fife

KY16 9DS

Tel: 01334 464610

Website: www.itspublicknowledge.info
E-mail: enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info
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